
Bid Summary
Bid #2270: 2025 Staff and Participant Apparel

Bid Submission Deadline: October 31, 2024 at 2pm
Bid Opening: October 31, 2024 at 2:15pm

Bidder
Category A:        

Aquatics Staff Apparel
Category B:              

Hats and Lanyards

Category C:            
Summer Camp 

Apparel -                   
Staff & Participant

Category D:       
Program Apparel - 
Staff & Participant

Category E:                 
Division Staff Apparel

Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas, Inc.
8120 Westglen Drive $4,595.55 $3,979.74 $31,556.65 $26,131.57 $16,621.62 

Houston, Texas 77063
All-Star Elite Sports

1871 North Gaffey Street, Suite C $5,907.22 $6,053.48 $37,081.90 $30,087.91 No Bid
San Pedro, California 90731

Original Watermen, Inc.
1198 Joshua Way $8,436.00 No Bid $37,330.50 No Bid No Bid

Vista, California 92081
ParkInk

7040 Ave. Encinas #104 $4,366.00 $4,438.00 $44,506.50 $35,107.80 $21,170.10 
Carlsbad, California 92011
The Woolenwear Company

739 Pinecrest Drive $5,384.92 $3,834.00 $34,216.10 $31,238.23 $14,590.13 
Prospect Heights, Illinois 60070
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