NORTHBROOK
PARK DISTRICT

Bid Summary

Bid #2254: 2024 Staff and Participant Apparel
Bid Submission Deadline: October 26, 2023 @ 2pm

Bid Opening: October 26, 2023 @ 2:15pm

Prospect Heights, Illinois 60070

Category C:
Category A: Category B: Summer Camp Category D: Category E: Category F:
Bidder ] Program Apparel - . ...
Aquatics Staff Apparel Hats & Bags Apparel - .. Soccer Uniforms Division Staff Apparel
L. Staff & Participant
Staff & Participant
Northern Safety and Industrial
232 Industrial Park Drive $7,053.67 No Bid No Bid $22,277.70 No Bid No Bid
Frankfort, New York 13340
Parkink
7040 Ave. Encinitas #104 $4,605.00 $4,874.00 $15,980.00 $21,632.25 $79,584.00 $9,956.00
Carlsbad, California 92011
Score Sports
726 East Anaheim Street No Bid No Bid No Bid Non-Conforming Bid $56,206.20 No Bid
Wilmington, California 90744
Sunburst Sportswear
95 N. Brandon Drive $5,476.64 No Bid $10,979.40 $17,191.08 No Bid $10,171.48
Glendale Heights, lllinois 60139
Woolenwear/PersonaliTee's
739 Pinecrest Drive $5,041.82 $3,962.39 $10,505.36 $19,607.89 $154,372.23 Non-Conforming Bid
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