Bid Summary

Bid #2211: Recreation Guide Printing
Bid Submission Deadline: December 20, 2021 @ 1:00pm
Bid Opening: December 20, 2021 @ 1:15pm

NORTHBROOK
PARK DISTRICT

. : . ith 1 . .
Option A: Saddle Stiched with 100# Base Bid: 2022 Optional Renewal | Optional Renewal

Bidder Cover Stock Year 1: 2023 Year 2: 2024

Grace Printing & Mailing
3425 Cleveland Street Spring Guide No Bid No Bid No Bid
Skokie, IL 60076

Summer Guide No Bid No Bid No Bid
Autumn Guide No Bid No Bid No Bid
Winter Guide No Bid No Bid No Bid

TOTAL BASE BID for Recreation Guides

. No Bid No Bid No Bid
(does not include postage)

Lake County Press (LCP)
98 Noll Street Spring Guide $37,816.00 No Bid No Bid
Waukegan, IL 60085

Summer Guide $37,816.00 No Bid No Bid
Autumn Guide $37,816.00 No Bid No Bid
Winter Guide $37,816.00 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL BASE BID for Recreation Guides

151,264.00 No Bid No Bid
(does not include postage) >
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NORTHBROOK
PARK DISTRICT

Bid Summary

Bid #2211: Recreation Guide Printing
Bid Submission Deadline: December 20, 2021 @ 1:00pm
Bid Opening: December 20, 2021 @ 1:15pm

Option B: Perfect Bound with 100#

Optional Renewal

Optional Renewal

Bidd B Bid: 2022
aaer Cover Stock ase Bl Year 1: 2023 Year 2: 2024
Grace Printing & Mailing
3425 Cleveland Street Spring Guide $38,138.00 $40,044.00 $41,951.00
Skokie, IL 60076
Summer Guide $38,138.00 $40,044.00 $41,951.00
Autumn Guide $38,138.00 $40,044.00 $41,951.00
Winter Guide $38,138.00 $40,044.00 $41,951.00
TOTAL BASE BID for Recreation Guides
. on =ul $152,552.00 $160,176.00 $167,804.00
(does not include postage)
Lake County Press (LCP)
98 Noll Street Spring Guide $41,436.00 No Bid No Bid
Waukegan, IL 60085
Summer Guide $41,436.00 No Bid No Bid
Autumn Guide $41,436.00 No Bid No Bid
Winter Guide $41,436.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL BASE BID for Recreation Guides
I ul $165,744.00 No Bid No Bid

(does not include postage)
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Bid Summary

Bid #2211: Recreation Guide Printing
Bid Submission Deadline: December 20, 2021 @ 1:00pm
Bid Opening: December 20, 2021 @ 1:15pm

NORTHBROOK
PARK DISTRICT

Option C: Saddle Stiched with 80# . Optional Renewal | Optional Renewal
Base Bid: 2022

Bidder
! Cover Stock Year 1: 2023 Year 2: 2024

Grace Printing & Mailing
3425 Cleveland Street Spring Guide No Bid No Bid No Bid
Skokie, IL 60076

Summer Guide No Bid No Bid No Bid
Autumn Guide No Bid No Bid No Bid
Winter Guide No Bid No Bid No Bid

TOTAL BASE BID for Recreation Guides

. No Bid No Bid No Bid
(does not include postage)

Lake County Press (LCP)
98 Noll Street Spring Guide $37,412.00 No Bid No Bid
Waukegan, IL 60085

Summer Guide $37,412.00 No Bid No Bid
Autumn Guide $37,412.00 No Bid No Bid
Winter Guide $37,816.00 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL BASE BID for Recreation Guides

149, . No Bid No Bid
(does not include postage) >149.648.00 ! !
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NORTHBROOK
PARK DISTRICT

Bid Summary

Bid #2211: Recreation Guide Printing
Bid Submission Deadline: December 20, 2021 @ 1:00pm
Bid Opening: December 20, 2021 @ 1:15pm

Option D: Perfect Bound with 80#

Optional Renewal

Optional Renewal

Bidd B Bid: 2022
iader Cover Stock ase Bl Year 1: 2023 Year 2: 2024
Grace Printing & Mailing
3425 Cleveland Street Spring Guide $37,860.00 $39,753.00 $41,646.00
Skokie, IL 60076
Summer Guide $37,860.00 $39,753.00 $41,646.00
Autumn Guide $37,860.00 $39,753.00 $41,646.00
Winter Guide $37,860.00 $39,753.00 $41,646.00
TOTAL BASE BID for R tion Guid
fornecreation SUIGes| — <151,440.00 $159,012.00 $166,584.00
(does not include postage)
Lake County Press (LCP)
98 Noll Street Spring Guide $41,023.00 No Bid No Bid
Waukegan, IL 60085
Summer Guide $41,023.00 No Bid No Bid
Autumn Guide $41,023.00 No Bid No Bid
Winter Guide $41,023.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL BASE BID for Recreation Guides . .
$164,092.00 No Bid No Bid

(does not include postage)
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