Bid Summary
Bid #2208: 2022 Staff and Participant Apparel
Bid Submission Deadline: January 13, 2022 @ 2pm
Bid Opening: January 6, 2022 @ 2:15pm

NORTHBROOK
PARK DISTRICT

Category E: Category F: Category G:
Category A: Category B: Category C: gory 8 y- . gory
. A Category D: Flag| Summer Camp | Hockey Training Program Category H: Soccer
Bidder Aquatics Staff Basketball Hats, Bags & i
Football Jerseys | Apparel Staff Academy Apparel Staff Uniforms
Apparel Jerseys Lanyards L. L.
Participants Jerseys Paticipants

Sunburst Sportswear
95 Brandon Drive $3,704.00 $1,733.64 No Bid $598.80 $7,625.13 No Bid $16,663.60 No Bid
Glendale Heights ,IL 60139

All Star Custom Apparel & Design
45 High Tech Drive $4,297.53 $2,129.30 No Bid $799.20 $8,995.32 No Bid $18,761.66 No Bid
Rush, NY 14543

Riddell Consumer
7501 Performance Lane $5,421.95 $2,977.70 $3,796.50 $1,821.60 $13,239.92 No Bid $26,125.40 No Bid
North Ridgeville, OH 44039

American Soccer Inc
726 E Anaheim Steet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46,258.20
Wilmington, CA 90744

Arena Sports
820 Black Partridge Road No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57,996.84
McHenry, IL 60051
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